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SIGNIFICANT AIRBORN SURVEY COMPLETED EXPLORATION UPDATE 

Slave Lake Zinc (“Slave Lake” or “the Company”) (CSE:SLZ) has now completed the data 
acquisition phase of the planned detailed airborne geophysical survey at the Company’s 
O’Connor Lake, NWT, exploration project. 

The airborne magnetic and VLF EM survey was flown by the Company’s contractor, Precision 
Geophysics, at a line spacing of 50 meters using a helicopter-based geophysical system. A total 
of 880 line kilometers was flown covering the property’s structural control corridor.  

Data processing and interpretation is underway with target recommendations for follow up 
ground-based exploration and drilling programs expected shortly. 

Slave Lake Zinc’s O’Connor Lake property has had significant historical exploration work 
completed by a developer in the early 1950’s (as reported previously). At that time work included 
constructing a 45 kilometer winter access road, 62 drill holes totalling 4121 meters of core drilling 
and sinking of a three compartment shaft to 55 meters with a level established at 45 meters to 
access the vein. A 26.3 ton bulk sample sent to the Trail smelter graded 55.0% Pb, 13.5% Zn and 
2.7 OPT Ag. 

The Company is looking forward to sharing the compiled data with their “Collaboration 
Agreement” partners in the Northwest Territory Metis Nation in order to discuss its plans for 
further exploration at O’Connor Lake. 

 

About Slave Lake Zinc 

Slave Lake Zinc Corp. intends to develop the potential of its O'Connor Lake property, an historic 
zinc lead copper property located in the Northwest Territories of Canada.  The property is located 
south of Great Slave Lake and to the east of Osisko Metals' Pine Point project.  The property was 
initially developed after the Second World War and subsequently abandoned in 1952 when the 
prices of zinc and lead collapsed post war.  Slave Lake Zinc Corp. believes that it is well positioned 
to advance this project and to expand significantly the historic potential of the property.  For 
more information please visit www.zinccorp.ca. 
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accepted responsibility for the adequacy or accuracy of the content of this news release 
 
Forward Looking Statement 
Statements in this news release that are forward-looking statements are subject to various risks 
and uncertainties concerning the specific factors disclosed here and elsewhere in both Slave Lake 
Zinc’s periodic filings with Canadian securities regulators. When used in this news release, words 
such as "will", "plan", "estimate", "expect", "intend", "potential", "should," and similar 
expressions, are forward-looking statements. Information provided in this document is necessarily 
summarized and may not contain all available material information. Forward-looking statements 
include, without limitation, statements regarding the progress of a definitive offtake agreement, 
potential development and production at the Company’s O’Connor lake project, future oriented 
events and other statements that are not facts. Forward-looking statements are based on a few 
assumptions and estimates that, while considered reasonable by management based on the 
business and markets in which Slave Lake Zinc operates, are inherently subject to significant 
operational, economic and competitive uncertainties and contingencies. Such forward-looking 
statements should therefore be construed in light of such factors. Although Slave Lake Zinc has 
attempted to identify important factors that could cause actual results, performance or 
achievements to differ materially from those contained in the forward-looking statements, there 
can be other factors that cause results, performance or achievements not to be as anticipated, 
estimated or intended. There can be no assurance that such information will prove to be accurate 
or that management's expectations or estimates of future developments, circumstances or results 
will materialize. Accordingly, readers should not place undue reliance on forward-looking 
statements. The forward-looking statements in this news release are made as of the date of this 
news release, and Slave Lake Zinc disclaims any intention or obligation to update or revise such 
information, except as required by applicable law, and Slave Lake Zinc does not assume any 
liability for disclosure relating to any other company herein. 


