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Item 1  Name and Address of Company  
 
Anonymous Intelligence Company Inc. (the “Company”) 
885 W Georgia St #900 
Vancouver, BC V6C 3H1 
 
Item 2  Date of Material Change  
 
October 10, 2024 
 
Item 3  News Release  
 
The news release attached hereto as Schedule “A” announcing the material change described herein 
was disseminated through the news dissemination services of Stockwatch on October 10, 2024. 
 
Item 4  Summary of Material Change  
 
The Company announced the appointment of Kevin Kowbel as a director of the Company effective 
immediately.  
 
Item 5  Full Description of Material Change 

 
5.1  Full Description of Material Change 
 
See the attached news release for a full description of the material change. 

 
5.2  Disclosure for Restructuring Transactions  

 
Not applicable. 
 
Item 6  Reliance on Subsection 7.1(2) of National Instrument 51-102  
 
Not applicable. 
 
Item 7  Omitted Information  
 
Not applicable. 
 
Item 8  Executive Officer  
 
Nilda Rivera, CFO 
Telephone: (604) 669-9788 

 
Item 9   Date of Report  
 
October 10, 2024 
 
 
 



ANON APPOINTS KEVIN KOWBEL TO ITS BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

News Release - Vancouver, British Columbia, October 10, 2024 – Anonymous Intelligence Company Inc. 
(CSE: ANON) (OTC: ANICF) (FRANKFURT: 1JI0) (“ANON” or the “Company”), a leading decentralized 
network, data storage technology and AI tools developer company, is pleased to announce the 
appointment of Kevin Kowbel as a director of the Company effective immediately. 

Over the past 25 years, Kevin Kowbel has grown into a dynamic, engineering-driven executive, 
contributing to five E&P companies. As a business leader, he has successfully overseen the delivery of 
over $30 billion in global capital projects, on time and under budget. In addition to his operational 
leadership, Kevin has been instrumental in fostering innovation, contributing to the development of 
patented and black-box technologies aimed at optimizing well performance and enhancing efficiency. His 
impact extends beyond the energy sector, where he has driven growth in both public and private 
companies across various industries. Kevin’s  commitment to technology and innovation is central to his 
work, with a strong focus on creating solutions that shape better futures. 

More than just an investor, Kevin has taken on ownership and key leadership in numerous companies 
that have thrived under his expertise, guidance, and business acumen. As a co-founder of QuantaSphere 
Technology Inc., Kevin is leading the mass commercialization of patented encapsulation technology 
designed to reduce chemical-borne illnesses, with potential applications across multiple industries. 

Building on his extensive experience in the in oil and gas sector, Kevin recently founded an oil and gas 
technology company poised to revolutionize global heavy oil and bitumen production. This innovative 
technology seeks to transform heavy ‘dirty’ oils into medium ‘cleaner’ oils while reducing carbon 
emissions and reliance on chemicals. 

Fueled by his passion for machine-based learning, Kevin was appointed Chairman and CEO of a 
technology development company that uses advanced mathematics to drive stakeholder value. He is 
eager to leverage ANON’s VPN, SDK, and developing AI technologies to tackle real-world challenges and 
create value for ANON’s subscribers, collaborators, and shareholders. 

Kevin's commitment to personal accountability and continuous improvement is unwavering, exemplified 
by his daily use of a simple credo represented by the acronym WWIDD: What Would I Do Differently? 

"We are thrilled to welcome Kevin to the Board," stated Denis Franks, CEO and director. "Kevin is a 
dynamic leader with exceptional skills and a passion for innovative technologies. His extensive experience 
and proven track record in technology global businesses will be invaluable to ANON as we continue to 
build our proprietary software technologies.  We eagerly anticipate the valuable insights he will bring to 
our team." 
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On Behalf of the Board,  
ANONYMOUS INTELLIGENCE COMPANY INC.  
 
Denis Franks 
CEO  
 
About Anonymous Intelligence Company Inc.  
 
Anonymous Intelligence Company Inc. (CSE: ANON) (OTC: ANICF) (FRANKFURT: 1JI0) is a leading 
computational intelligence, decentralized network, and data technology company. Leveraging its 
proprietary suite of AI and privacy-enabled products, ANON aims to empower individuals and businesses 
to have increased confidence in technology. Through its innovative solutions, ANON is committed to 
delivering cutting-edge technology while prioritizing user privacy and data security. For more information 
about Anonymous Intelligence Company and its suite of products, please visit www.anonintelco.com.  
 
Neither the Canadian Securities Exchange nor its regulation services provider accepts responsibility for the 
adequacy of accuracy of this release. No stock exchange, securities commission or other regulatory 
authority has approved or disapproved the information contained herein 
 
Forward-Looking Statements  
 
Certain statements in this press release are forward-looking statements and are prospective in nature. 
Forward-looking statements are not based on historical facts, but rather on current expectations and 
projections about future events, and are therefore subject to risks and uncertainties which could cause 
actual results to differ materially from the future results expressed or implied by the forward-looking 
statements. These statements generally can be identified by the use of forward-looking words such as 
“may”, “should”, “will”, “could”, “intend”, “estimate”, “plan”, “anticipate”, “expect”, “believe” or 
“continue”, or the negative thereof or similar variations. Forward-looking statements in this news release 
include statements regarding the Company’s ability to successfully launch products and expand 
partnerships, and the ability of the new management to use his experience to positively impact ANON’s 
business. Such statements are qualified in their entirety by the inherent risks and uncertainties that the 
proceeds of the Offering may be used other than as set out in this news release and other factors beyond 
the control of the Company. Such forward-looking statements should therefore be construed in light of 
such factors, and the Company is not under any obligation, and expressly disclaims any intention or 
obligation, to update or revise any forward-looking statements, whether as a result of new information, 
future events or otherwise. 


