
 

GLOBAL CARE CAPITAL RECEIVES BITCOIN MINING MACHINES 

 
February 17th, 2022 - Vancouver, BC - Global Care Capital Inc. (CSE: HLTH, Frankfurt: L6V2) (the 
“Company” or “Global Care”) an emerging incubator of venture-stage companies and the owner of a 
developing portfolio of cryptocurrency mining and royalty assets is pleased to announce the 
acquisition of 133 Bitmain Antminer S19J Pro bitcoin mining machines (the “Mining Machines”). 
 
The Mining Machines represent the settlement of a previously announced acquisition from Compute 
North LLC which provided for the purchase of 975 ASIC miners as disclosed in the Company’s June 
3, 2021, press release. The new agreement allows for the scaling up of operations while maintaining 
our relationship with Compute North LLC. 
 
The Mining Machines, capable of 13,796 terahashes per second, are among the best in application-
specific bitcoin mining hardware. The Company expects to be announcing that they will be put into 
service at a suitable facility, with competitively priced power. 
 
“These machines and this agreement represent a strong start to a cryptocurrency mining operation 
that we intend to grow aggressively,” Hugh Maddin, Interim CEO, said. “Cost-controlled bitcoin mining 
is a cornerstone of our strategy, and this is a strong step in that direction.” 
 
The hardware portion of the Company’s strategy is being undertaken in conjunction with a royalty 
strategy that creates lasting interests in bitcoin-generating nodes. The Company’s wholly owned 
subsidiary ASIC Power Co. currently receives a royalty revenue equal to a hashing power of 5.5 
petahashes per second, equivalent to a mined total of approximately 7.75 BTC, and counting. 
 
The machines delivered today represent a fulfillment of the hardware delivery that was due to Global 
Care under the agreement announced June 3,2021. 
 
The Company continues with its change of management and rebranding and expects that further 
announcements will be made in the coming weeks and months as strategy is fine-tuned and new 
management is engaged. 
 
 
About Global Care  

Global Care Capital is a global investment company which specializes in providing early-stage financing 
to private and public companies. The Company engages in new, early-stage investment opportunities 
in previously underdeveloped assets and obtaining positions in early-stage investment opportunities 
that adequately reflect the risk profile. 
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The CSE does not accept responsibility for the adequacy or accuracy of this release. 
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