
 

LEGAL_32195285.1 

NETCOINS HOLDINGS INC. 

 
NETCOINS ANNOUNCES RECORD DATE FOR SHARE CONSOLIDATION 

 
Vancouver, British Columbia, November 7, 2019 - Netcoins Holdings Inc. (the “Company” or “Netcoins 
Holdings”) (CSE: NETC), announces that, further to its news release of October 15, 2019, the company 
will complete a consolidation of the authorized and issued common shares of the Company (the “Common 
Shares”) on the basis of a one (1) post-consolidated Common Share for each twenty-five (25) pre-
consolidation Common Shares (the “Consolidation”). 

No fractional Common Shares will be issued upon the Consolidation.  In the event a holder of Common 
Shares would otherwise be entitled to receive a fractional Common Share in connection with the 
Consolidation, the number of Common Shares to be received by such shareholder will be rounded down to 
the next whole number if that fractional Common Share is less than one half (1/2) of a Common Share, and 
will be rounded up to the next whole number of Common Shares if that fractional Common Share is equal 
to or greater than one half (1/2) of a Common Share. 

The record date for the completion of the Consolidation is November 13, 2019. 

 

ON BEHALF OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 
 
“Kevin Ma” 
 
Kevin Ma,  
Chief Financial Officer 
  
For information please contact Netcoins at 604.340.5846 or ir@gonetcoins.com. 
 

Cautionary Statement Regarding “Forward-Looking” Information 
This information release contains certain forward-looking information. Such information involves known 
and unknown risks, uncertainties and other factors that may cause actual results, performance or 
achievements to be materially different from those implied by statements herein, and therefore these 
statements should not be read as guarantees of future performance or results. All forward-looking 
statements are based on the Company's current beliefs as well as assumptions made by and information 
currently available to it as well as other factors. Readers are cautioned not to place undue reliance on 
these forward-looking statements, which speak only as of the date of this press release. Due to risks and 
uncertainties, including the risks and uncertainties identified by the Company in its public securities filings, 
actual events may differ materially from current expectations. The Company disclaims any intention or 
obligation to update or revise any forward-looking statements, whether as a result of new information, 
future events or otherwise. 


